RESOLUTION NO. 2017 -_ 64

A RESOLUTION BY THE BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS OF ST. JOHNS COUNTY,
FLORIDA, AUTHORIZING THE COUNTY ADMINISTRATOR, OR DESIGNEE, TO PURCHASE
AND TO EXECUTE A PURCHASE ORDER FOR SIX NEW 2017 FORD F-150 EXTENDED CAB
PICKUP TRUCKS 4X4

RECITALS

WHEREAS, the County seeks to- purchase of six (6) 2017 Ford F-150 Extended Cab Pickup Trucks
4X4; and -

WHEREAS, in accordance with section 302.6.5.4 of the St. Johns County Purchasing Manual, entitled
“Piggyback or Cooperative Purchasing”, the County is authorized make said purchase subject to the terms and
conditions of Florida State Contract #25100000-16-1 (“Contract™); and

WHEREAS, purchase of the pickup trucks will be funded by the Growth Management, Traffic
Operations and Utility Department; and

WHEREAS, the County has reviewed the terms, provisions, conditions and requirements of the
Contract and finds that entering into the Contract for purchase of the pickup trucks serves a public purpose.

NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED BY THE BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
OF ST, JOHNS COUNTY, FLORIDA, as follows:

Section 1. The above Recitals are incorporated by reference into the body of this Resolution and such
Recitals are adopted as finds of fact.

Section 2, The County Administrator, or designee, is hereby authorized to purchase six (6) 2017 Ford F-
150 Extended Cab Pickup Trucks 4X4.

Section 3. In accordance with the terms and conditions of the Contract, the County Administrator, or
designee, is further authorized to execute a purchase order in the amount of $245,961.50 for purchase of the
extended cab pickup truck 4X4 from Duval Ford.

Section 4. To the extent that there are typographical and/or administrative errors that do not change the
tone, tenor, or concept of this Resolution, then this Resolution may be revised without subsequent approval by
the Board of County Commissioners.

~ PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of County Commissioners of St. Johns County, Florida, this
213" day of _ Teln e ,2017.

ATTEST: Hunter S Conrad Clerk BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
OF ST. JOHNS CO Y, FLORIDA

Deputy Clelk o T James K. Jg%%ir
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Motor Vehicles 25100000-16-1

Effective Period  11/17/2015 through 11/16/2017
Contract Type State Term Contract

s Pricin
¢ Contractors
Contracit How to Use this Contract
Information Frequently Asked Questions - Users

Frequently Asked Questions - Vendors

Forms and Other Information

Contract » Microsoft Word (% 203.33 KB)
Documents PDF (.4 2.08 MB)
Amendments_ and Memorandums
Contract + Jennifer Hyatt

_ - » (850) 414-6741 .
Administration . jennifer.hyatt@dms.myflorida.com

. UNSPSC-25101500, UNSPSC-25101503, UNSPSC-25101505, UNSPSC-25101507
Commodity Codes ycpsc-35101600, UNSPSC-25101702 ' '

Description

This is a statewide contract for Motor Vehicles. This contract provides State Agencies and eligible users with the ability to
purchase new 2016 models at a discount off of MSRP on: automoblles, passenger vans, cargo vans, sport utility vehicles,
light pickup trucks, chassis-cab trucks, low-speed vehicles, truck bodies, and installed options. Styles Include: Law
Enforcement Automobiles, Law Enforcement SUVs, Law Enforcement Motorcycles, Automobiles, Low-Speed Vehicles,
Passenger Vans, Cargo Vans, SUVs, and Pickup and Chassis-Cab Trucks (Class 1 through Class 5).

The Department strongly encourages ALL potential users of this contract to plan ahead to prevent any potential delays.
Please review the Contract Documents, "How to Use this Contract" Instructions, and "Frequently Asked Questions” for this

State Term Contract.
Benefits

State of Florida Base Vehicle Prices and Options Discounts equate to average approximate discount 70% percent off of list
price (MSRP).

« Additional discounts possible for large quantity, identical motor vehicle, orders,

Brands Include: Chevrolet, Ciub Car, Cruise Car, Dodge, Ford, Freightliner, GEM, GMC, Jeep, Motor Electric, Nissan,
Toyota, Harley -Davidson, International and RAM,

 Wide product selection with approximately 755 State of Florida Base Vehicles on contract, each with assoclated Manufacturer's
Options, and select Aftermarket Options.

Manufacturer's standard most-inclusive government Warranty.

Lead-Time: Approximate 30 - 190 Days (Based on State of Florida base vehicle, options and production).




Prices established for th-e State of Florida Base Vehicles individually include the following charges and fees:

. Administrative

. Environmental

. Title Application and Registration

. Plate Transfer

. Preparation

. Handling

. Freight

. Shipping

. FOB Delivery to any point within the State of Florida
10. Warranty and

11. Any other charges or fees necessary to deliver the State of Florida Base Vehicle according to the

O 0 N O U1 A W N =

requirements,
specifications, terms, and conditions, exclusive of taxes.

Document reader downioad link

. "u“_"MS Word Viewer
« |7 Adobe PDF Reader




25100000-16-1 Motor Vehicles

State of Florida

Vendor Information Form

Contractor Information

Respondent Name:

Duval Ford LLC.

E§§pondent FEIN | 57 3546082
Street Address: 1616 CASSAT AVE

City, State, and Zip:

JACKSONVILLE, FL 32210

Internet Address:

WWW.DUVALFORD.COM

Telephone No.:

904-381-2144

Toll-Free No.:
Fax No.: 904-381-6556
Contract Administers
Information: Primary Contact Secondary Contact
Name: MATT FORTE GARY CHARLESWORTH
Title: GOVERNMENT SALES MANAGER OPERATIONS MANAGER
Street Address: 1616 CASSAT AVE 1616 CASSAT AVE

City, State, and Zip:

JACKSONVILLE, FL 32210

JACKSONVILLE, FL 32210

E-mail Address:

MATT.FORTE@DUVALFLEET.COM

GARY.CHARLESWORTH@DUVALFLEET.CO
M

Telephone No: 904-381-2144 904-381-2144
Toll-Free No.:

Cell Phone No.: 904-505-9682

Fax No.: 904-381-6556

Ordering and Remit-To Information Please provide information where Customers should direct
orders. You must provide a regular mailing address and e-mail address. If equipped to receive
purchase orders electronically, you may also provide an Internet Address.

' Remit-To: DUVAL FORD LLC
Remit-To Street
Address: 1616 CASSAT AVE
Remit-To City,

State, and Zip:

JACKSONVILLE, FL 32210

Remit-To E-mail
Address:

MATT.FORTE@DUVALFLEET.COM
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Attachment D.4 - Price Sheet - Light Trucks and .mmo: Utility Vehicles

e
i

Sub-Groups C-D: Trucks Under 1 Ton

Commodity Code No. 25101507; LIGHT TRUCKS OR SPORT UTILITY VEHICLES

Updated 12.2.2016

- #1dentified Aftermarket Options
Elangs Mounted, Price! Shivids, Yave-On. |- Comuass, Price. |- inch Length, Price.
REEA Ca 2 s 189.00 NoBid No Bid NoBid
116 {2017 Nissn Frontier 4WD Crew Cab LWB Auto SV (33217) LR -
e - - Alan Jay Nissans tne, s s 189.00 189.00 No Bid No Bl
EPA Class: 1/2 Yon Plckup
Truck 4WD 117 2097 Chevrolet Sitverado 1500 WD Reg Cab 119.07 Work Truck (CK15703) Garber Chevrolet Ponfizc GMC 04120 No Bid 12600 No Bid No Bld
Jrugk
118 [2017 Chavrolet Siivarado 1500 4WD Reg Cab 149.07 LT wetLT (CK15703} Sarksr Chevroiet Pontiac GG 20120 No 8ld 128.00 No Bid No BId
Tryck
Garber Chevroiet Pontlac GMC 20-120 No Bld 126.00 No Bid Ne Bid
119 2017 Chevrolet Siiverado 1500 WD Reg Cab 133.0° Work Truck (CK15%03) __Inuck T
herole w01z |s 109.00 18900 NoBId [$ 551000
Cadlilac
120 |2017 Chevrolet SRverado 1500 4WD Reg Cab 133.0° LT wriLT (CK15903) mﬁﬁhwﬂﬁ.am.EP s0-120 Ne Bid 126.00 No Bid NoBld
Truck
arbar Chavrelet Porgiac OG- 30120 NoBid 126.00 No Bld No Bid
121 |2017 Chevrolet Stiverado 1500 4WD Double Cab 1435~ Work Truck (CK15753) pres ..hhl-_w!: oue
‘Alan Jay Chevrolet Buick GMC
rerolet| i |s 189.00 w00 |5 574100 No Bid
Garber Chyvreiet Peties SHG 0120 No 8l 12690 No Bid NoBId
122 2017 Chevrolat Silverado 1500 4WD Double Cab 143.57 LY wriLT (CK15753) O\IE MG
Chavrolet Alan Jay Chevrolet Bulck GMC
e win s 1900 19900 |5 574100 NoBld
Pontiac GMC 20120 NoBid 12600 No Bi¢ No Bid
123 |2017 Chevrolet Siverado 1500 4WD Crew Cab 143.57 WT (CK15543) Jpisk
Alan Bulck GUC . | o |s 119.00 189.00 No 8Id No Bid
Ladliag
Sacker Chevislet Ponae MG . s0-120 No Bid 12600 No Bld No Bid
126 [2017 Chevrolet Siiverado 1500 WD Crew Cab 143.5% LT wiILT (CK15543) Jruct
Alap Jay Chevrolet Bylck GMC
e ! soaz0 |3 189,00 189.00 No Bld No Bid
Garber Chevrolet Portiag GMC | | 90120 No Bid 128.00 No Bl¢ No Bld
125 j2o0r 1800 4WD 183,07 WT ¢ o H.WW n
n
Chevrolet| oAz | 189.00 18900 NoBid NoBid
Cadilac
gﬁﬁnﬁ% 30120 No Bid 125.00 NoBld No 8id
s w7 1500 153.0° LT wiLT (CK15743) ™ e
Alan Jay Chevrolet Bujck GMC
Chevrolet 012 | 189.00 185,00 No 8ld No Bl
Ford
Don Reid Ford 2 is 250,00 25000 No Bid No Bl
177|207 Ford F-150 4WD Reg Cab 122.57 XL {F1E)
Garber Ford, Ine, 83120 NoBid 106.00 NoBid ¥o BId
Den Reld Ford 2 s 252.00 25200 NoBld NoBId
128 (2017 Ford F-150 4WD Reg Cab 122.57 XLT (FIE}
Duval Ford LG, wes s 160.00 160,00 NoBld NoBld
‘Don Reid Forg 2 | 250.00 250.00 No Bl No Bl
120 2047 Ford F-150 4WD Reg Cab 141° XL (F1E)
Garber Ford, Ine, s6.120 No Bid 108.00 NoBId No Bld
} Garber Ford, ine, 0120 No Bid 108.00 NoBid _No Bid
130 (2017 Ford F-150 4WD Reg Cab 141" XL wHD Payload Pkg (FIE)
Duval Fard LLC. uam (s 160.00 180,00 NoBId NoBld
Dot Reld Ford 20 |s 25000 250,00 No 314 Ne Bld
13 2017 Ford F-150 4WD Reg Cab 141~ XLT (F1E}
Dwval Ford UG, “et s 180.00 160.00 NoBHd No 814
432 |2017 Ford F-150 4WD Reg Cab 141" XLT wiHD Payload Pkg (FIE} Don Retd Ford. s 250.00 250.00 No Bid No Bid
Reld E s 250,00 250.00 NoBid NoBld
133 (2097 Ford F-150 WD SuperCab 145~ XL px18) Garber Ford, ine. %0120 No Bid 10600 No Bid No Bid
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Sub-Groups C-D: Trucks Under 1 Ton

Commodity Code No. 25101507; LIGHT TRUCKS OR SPORT UTILITY VEHICLES

Updated 12.2.2016

Pages of 12

: : identified Options"!
“Base Veticie | OEM Options —— -
Prics (HA#M00) || Duoount | Leadime i | yepe Rain shiede, | Vent/Raia . |- ServiceBody. | Sefvioeod. %
(BH%) Days (44 | Flange Moynted, Pricet Shiekts, Taoe-On. . Compast Price (- inch Lenath, Price
; s s 180.00 | 3 180.00 NoBid NoBid
20 |s 250,00 | § 25000 No Bld No Big
2017 Ford F-150 4WD SupesCab 145” XLT (X1E)
s s 16000 | s 16000 No BId NoBld
w s 2500 | 5 250,00 No Bid No Bl
138 [2017 Ford F-150 WD Supercab 183" XL (x15) Duyal Ford LLC, s |3 180,00 | 3 160.00 No Bld No Bld
Garber Ford, Inc. 80120 NoBid | $ 106.00 No Bid No Bid
Don Reid Ford 2 s 25000 | 5 25000 No Bid No Bid
138 (2017 Ford F-130 XL 4WD SuperCab & Box w HD/Paylosd Pkg (X1E.$27)
Garber Ford, Inc, 30120 woBid | § 108.00 No Bid No Bid
Don Reld Ford 2 s 2s0.00 | 3 250.00 NoBid No Bid
137 2017 Ford F-150 XL 4WD SuperCab 6.5° Box (X1E)
Duval Ford LAC, was |s 160.00 | 3 160.00 No Bid No Bld
Don Reid Ford m |s 25000 | s 250.00 No 81d NoBid
138 [2017 Foed F-150 (K1E) XLT 4WD SuperCsb 3° Box w HDIPayload Pxg (X1E,627)
ral Ford LLC. 34-38 s 16000 { $ 160.00 No Bid Neo Bid
Don Reld Ford 2 s 25000 | 5 250,00 NoBld NoBld
139 {2017 Ford F-150 AWD SuperCrew 145* XL (W1E)
Garber Ford, Inc, 10120 NoBid | 108,00 No Bl No Bl
Don Reig Ford 2 s 25000 | 3 250,00 No BId No Bld
149 {2017 Ford F-150 WD SuperCrew 145% XLT (W1E)
Duval Ford LLG, 8453 L] 160.00 | $ 160,00 No Bid Na 8id
Don Reld Ford 1 s 25000 | 5 25000 NoBid No Bid
141 |2017 Ford F-150 AWD SuperCrew 15T XL (WIE) Garber Ford, I 0120 NoBid | S 100.00 NoBld No Bid
Dival Ford 4G, s |3 16000 { 5 160.00 NoBig No Bid
Don Reld Ford m |s 25000 | 250.00 No Blg No Bid
142 2016 Ford F-150 4WD SuperCrew 157" XL wiHD Payload Pkg (W1E)
Garber Ford, Ine. 90120 NoBMd | S 106.00 No Bid No Bld
Don Reid Ford. 2 s 25000 | § 250.00 No Bid No Bid
143 2017 Ford F-150 4WD SuperCrew 157~ XLT (WIE)
i Pord wos s 160,00 | 5 160.00 NoBId No Bld
Pon Rejd Ford 120 s 28000 | 250.00 No Bld No Bld
144 [2017 Ford F-150 WD SuperCrew 157 XLT wiHD Payload Pkg (W1E)
Duval Ford LG, e |3 18000 | 5 160.00 NoBId No Bid
GMc y Garber Chevrojet Pontiaq GMC
145 [2017 GMC Sierra 1500 4WD Regutar Cab 119.0% (TK15703) et £ 20120 NoBid |5 126,00 No Bid No Bid
146 |2017 GMC Slerra 1500 4WD Regutar Cab 119.07 SLE {TK15703) Garber Chevrolet Pontiac GG, Hn!aun 20120 NoBid | s 126,00 ‘NoBld No Big
147 |2017 GMC Slerra 1500 4WD Regular Cab 133.0 (TK15903) EPQ%EE! : 80120 NoBid | 5 126.00 No Bid No Bld
Inuek
1438|2017 GMC Sierra 1500 4WD Regutar Cab 133,07 SLE (TK15503) E@Eﬁ!&?ﬁhﬁl ] 20120 NoBid | S 126.00 No Bld No Bld
_Truek
Gorber Chrrvrplet Pongias GHC 20120 NoBId | 5 128.00 No BId No Bld
148 {2017 GMC Sierra 1500 4WD Double Cab 143 5™ (TK15753) ™ -
Alan Jay Chevroles Buick GMG
aerolet ! so120 | 1900 | 8 18900 |3 s7at00 No Bid
Garber Chewrolet Pontisc GME_ | s0-120 NoBid | § 126.00 No Bl No Bid
160 [5017 QML Slarrn 1600 AW Aruchin Cab 147 €= K1 F (TKAR7RR Inick




State Employee

ST JOHNS COUNTY

= Contract Pricing

Stale Employees, as well as County and City
Employees and their immediate familes, can now get
thelr new Ford car, fruck or SUV at COST using
State Employse Contract Pricing.

CALL: (800) 646-0584 or go to
www.duvalford.com

Prepared for:

Contract Holder

8T JOHNS COUNTY . DOuval Ford Fleet Sales

JEFF NORDSEIK

Labor

Laura Torbett

{Work} 904-388-2144

(Fax) 904-387-6816

(Cell) 904-568-6027

Laura. Torbeli@duvalfleet.com

1616 Cassat Ave. Jax, FL 32210

PLEASC CONFIRM RECEINT OF QUOTE Vid EA1AIL

Equipment

2017 FORD F-150 4X4 EXTENDED CAB 4X4 PICKUP , X1E
6.6'80OX

6.0L V-8 ENGINE

6- SPEED AUTO TRANSMISISON
8l- FUEL PREP

CNG CONVERSION

POWER WINDOWS AND LOCKS
DEEP TINTED GLASS

THIRD KEY, PATS

CAB STEPS

LINEX SPRAY IN BEDLINER
DAYTIME RUNNING LIGHTS

TEMP TAG

Total labor haurs per spec. Includes wire, loom, connectors, PDI and shop supplies: $1356

1 appreciate your interest and the opportunily to quote. This quote has been prioed from Contraot # 25100000-16-1.
Viehicle will be ordered white exterior unless spsoified on purchase order.

Price

23,568.00

1,616.26

UNIT COST

TOTAL QUANTITY

Printed: 12/6/16

PLEASE CLEARLY NOTATE ON YOUR PURCHASE ORDER WHERE DUVAL FORD IS TO
SHIP YOUR VEHICLE, HOW THE VEHICLE IS TO BE TITLED, AND WHERE THE INVOICE
IS TO BE MAILED.

TOTAL PURCHASE

wew . duvalfleet.com

8T JOHNS X1E LT.xlsx




Price Quote Form (PQF) - Motor Vehicles
Contract No.: 25100000-16-1
Updated 12/1/2016
(STATE AGENCIES MUST ALSO SUBMIT MP6301)

: Imbortaﬁt < Contractor's must select Vendor Nahie, Vehicle Group (Drob Down), aﬁd Llné No. fdf the sheét to wofk.
Formulas are included in the BLUE and YELLOW shaded columns (auto-calculate)
Please complete only the unshaded white cells

. S Awarded Contractor Information
Vendor Name: (Drop Down} Duval Ford LLC.

Street Address: 1616 Cassat Avenue,

City, State, Zip: Jacksonville, FL 32210

Contact Person; LAURA TORBETT [Title: ] GOVERNMENT SALES
Original Quote Date: ] Revised Quote Date: | Est. Dellvery: I

Phone #'s: [Primary: 904-388-2144 X5426 | Secondary: 904-568-6027
Email Address: LAURA.TORBETT@DUVALFLEET.COM

Fax #: 904-387-6816

Vendor Purchase Order No.

: :- = Requesting Customernformation -
Agency/Organization Name: ST JOHNS COUNTY
Contact Parson: JEFF NORDSIEK [Title: I

Phone #'s:
Emall Address:
Fax #:

G il Ll econdary Customer Contact:i(optional):-—
Contact Person: [Title;
Phone #'s:
Emall Address:

Sub-Group D: TRUCK, UNDER ONE TON, PICKUP, 4WD
2017 Ford F-160 4WD SuperCab 145" XL (X1E) ) $ 23,668.00 " 5.00%
Manufacturer's OEM Dﬁs cHiption ST : MSRP OEM Optlons Total Discount Optlon Total Cost with .
Optlon Code(s) o o ’ SHEBH Discount % ~Dollars Applied Discount.: "
99F 5,0l V-8 GAS ENGINE $ 1,795.00 5.00% $ 89.75| $ 1,705,25
446 6- SPEED AUTO TRANSMISSION $ - 0 ) $ - $ -
98G |Bl FUEL PREP § 315.00 5.00% $ 1675 | § 299.25
67T ELECTRIC BRAKE CONTROLLER B 275,00 ~ 5.00% 3 1376 $ 261.25
85A POWER WINDOWS AND LOCKS 1,170.,00 5.00% 3 68,60 | $ 1,111.60
508 SPEED CONTROL b 225.00 5.00% $ 1126 $ 213.75
188 CAB STEPS $ 250.00 5.00% $ 1250 | $ 237,50
. 1413 SKID PLATES $ 160.00 5.00% $ 8001]$ 152,00
76C |BACK UP CAMEREA § 250.00 5.00% $ 12,60 | ¢ 237.50
942 DAYTIME RUNNING LIGHTS $ 45,00 5,00% $ 2.25 | § 42,75
0 $ - $ -
0 $ - $ *
0 $ - $ -
0 $ - $ -
0 $: - $ -
0 $ - $ -
0 $ - $ -
0 N - $ -
0 $ - b -
0 ] - J -
0 $ - $ -
0 $ - 3 M
0 3 - -
0 $ - 3 -
0 § - S -
0 $ - ] -
0 $ - J -
0 § - $ -
0 J - [ -
0 5 - [ -
. TOTAL COST; OEM OPTIONS $ 224,26 | § . 4,260,786
identlfled ST
MSRP MSRP Discount | Total Discount Optlon Total Cost with
Ag;g:::;:)et Description ' St % Dollars : Applied Disgount

Page 1 of 2




Price Quote Form (PQF) - Motor Vehicles

Contract No.: 26100000-16-1

$ -1$ -

$ -1 8 -

$ - $ -

$ B -

] - -

13 N

1% -

$ 4% -

1s -

] BE] -

P -5 P -

$ RE] -

$ -3 -

$ BE] -

$ -8 -

L TOTAL COST: IDENTIFIED AFTERMARKET OPTIONS $ - $ . -

'Non-Identified : ’ : ' : o ; e
i : MSRP MSRP.Dlscount | ‘Total Discount Option Total Cost with
Age:::r:)et o L *Description st % Dollars Applled Discount .

CNG CNG CONVERSION $ 12,000.00 $ - $ 12,000,00
924 DEEP TINTED GLASS W/ WINDSHIELD STRIP $ 345,00 $ - $ 3456.00
3K THIRD KEY, PATS $ 176,00 - 3 176.00
LINEX HD LINEX SPRAY IN BEDLINER $  550.00 - § 560.00
HD TOW TRAILER TOWING PACKAGE WITH 2" BALL 5 668,00 - ] 659.00
TEMP TEMPORARY TAG $ 6.00 - $ 6.00

$ -~ |'$ -

$ - $ -

] - $ -

] - 3 -

] - $ -

5 - $ -

$ - $ -

$ - $ -

$ - $ -

g - $ -

§ - E -

$ - $ -

§ - $ -

§ - $ -

§ - $ -

§ - $ -

- $ -

$ - $ -

$ - $ -

TOTAL COST: NON-IDENTIFIED AFTERMARKET OPTIONS $ - L] 73,736.00|

S " GRAND TOTAL PER REPRESENTATIVE MODEL .5 S i e 41,664.76
Additional Savings Off Contract Price Per Vehicle® (Please provide detailed Information in Vendor Comments) $0.00
Total Vehlcles Quoted (Drop Down) 1
- : - 41,664.78.

Vendor Comments:

Addltlonal Savlngs for Example Quantlty, Dealer Special, Customer Picked Up Vehlcle Ex: DMS negotlated 350 off of contract prlce for XYZ

vehicie due to large order.

Agency Comments:

Please confirm vehicle color, If no color is specified then the default is white.

*UNSPSC = United Natlons Standard Products and Services Commodity Code

Page 2 of 2




