RESOLUTION NO. 2017 - QZO

A RESOLUTION BY THE BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS OF ST. JOHNS COUNTY,
FLORIDA, AUTHORIZING THE COUNTY ADMINISTRATOR, OR DESIGNEE, TO PURCHASE
AND TO EXECUTE A PURCHASE ORDER FOR TWO NEW 2017 FORD F-450 SERVICE BODY
TRUCKS WITH CRANES 4X2

RECITALS

WHEREAS, the County seeks to purchase of two (2) 2017 Ford F-450 Service Body Trucks with
Cranes 4X2; and

WHEREAS, in accordance with section 302.6.5.4 of the St. Johns County Purchasing Manual, entitled
“Piggyback or Cooperative Purchasing”, the County is authorized make said purchase subject to the terms and
conditions of Florida State Contract #25100000-16-1 (“Contract™); and

WHEREAS, purchase of the pickup trucks will be funded by the Utility Department; and

WHEREAS, the County has reviewed the terms, provisions, conditions and requirements of the
Contract and finds that entering into the Contract for purchase of the pickup trucks serves a public purpose.

NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED BY THE BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
OF ST. JOHNS COUNTY, FLORIDA, as follows:

Section 1. The above Recitals are incorporated by reference into the body of this Resolution and such
Recitals are adopted as finds of fact.

Section 2. The County Administrator, or designee, is hereby authorized to purchase two (2) 2017 Ford
F-450 Service Body Trucks with Cranes 4X2.

Section 3. In accordance with the terms and conditions of the Contract, the County Administrator, or
designee, is further authorized to execute a purchase order in the amount of $153,585.78 for purchase of the two -
service body trucks with cranes 4X2 from Duval Ford.

Section 4. To the extent that there are typographical and/or administrative errors that do not change the
tone, tenor, or concept of this Resolution, then this Resolution may be revised without subsequent approval by
the Board of County Commissioners.

+{ PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of County Commissioners of St. Johns County, Florida, this
T dayof  Auocihe ,2017.

ATTEST: Hunter S. Conrad, Clerk = - BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

)ﬂ W e OF ST. JOHNS COUNTY, FLORIDA
By: [lam NP N By: //*
Deputy Clerk Y James K. JohW

Renpimion paTe_3/ 7/ (1




Price Quote Form (PQF) - Motor Vehicles

Contract No.: 25100000-16-1

Updated 12/1/2016

(STATE AGENCIES MUST ALSO SUBMIT MP6301)

important - Confractor's must select Vendor Name, Vehicle Group (Drop Down), and Line No. for the sheet to work.

Formulas are included in the BLUE and YELLOW shaded columns (auto-calculate)

Please complete only the unshaded white cells

"7~ Awarded Contractor Information

Duval Ford LLC.

Vendor Nan‘m: ‘(bro;r) Down)
Street Address:

1616 Cassat Avenue,

{Clty, State, Zip: -

Jacksonvlile, FL. 32210 .

GOVERNMENT SALES

{Contact Person: LAURATORBETT [Title:
Original Quote Date: - . Revised Quote Date: Est.:Dellvery: . .|
[Primary. 904-388-2144 X5426 | Secondary: 904-568-6027
: LAURA.TORBETT@DUVALFLEET.COM

904-387-6816

Informati

ST JOHNS COUNTY

Contact Person: JEFF NORDSIEK
Phone #'s: 904-209-0283
Emall Address: - inordsiek@sjcfi.us

Contact Person: :

Phons #'s:

Emall Adg!ress:

Fax #:

el

Group 5: Product and Material Transport Vehicles —

K, GREATER THAN ONE TON & LESS THAN
AB SiE

72017 Ford Supér Duty F-450 DRW.2WD SuperCab 1687 WB 60" CA XL (X4G) . $ +:31,474.89
Manufacturer's OE}  Descilntion MSRP | OEMOptions | TotalDiscount-|. - Option Total Gostwith - |
“ Option Code(s) " - : : - pon . S### | Discount%h - Dollars . Applied Discount - -
99Y 6.8L V-10 GAS ENGINE - 0 $ ie $ i ; -
hﬁﬁP 6-SPEED AUTO TRANSMISSION - ’ 0 $ R i e
528 ELECTRIC BRAKE CONTROLLER b 270.00 5.00%" 135019 - 256.50
X4N LIMITED SLIP DIFFERENTIAL b 360.00 65.00% - 18,001% 342.00
585 - AM/ EM RADIO WITH SINGLE CD b 275.00 5.00% 13.751 $ 261.26
91M SYNC/ BLUETOOTH 365.00 5.00% 18.25 : 346,76
188 CAB STEPS 320.00 5.00% 216,001 % 304.00
90L POWER WINDOWS AND LOCKS 915.00 5.00% 45,75 1'% 869.26
512 FULL SIZE SPARE TIRE 350.00 5.00% ] 17501 § 332.50
942 DAYTIME RUNNING LIGHTS ] 45.00 5.00% i 2251§% 42,75
76C BACK UP AL ARM 140.00 5.00% 7001 % 133,00
1872 BACK UP CAMERA b 415.00 |. 5.00% 20.75 394.25
16S ALL WEATHER FLOOR MATS 3 80.00 | 5.00% 4.50 85,50
98F CNG PREP PACKAGE b 315.00 5,00% 15,76 209,25
0 [ - 5
2 - -
[ - -
0. B 5
0 b - f -
0 - -
) - -
0 - -
0 I -
0 T [ -
0 K -
0 “ $ -
0 b. - $ -
0 $ - b -
0’ b - b -
0 ] . =18 L -
s TOTAL COST: 'OEM OPTIONS : - 193.00{'$ : - 3,667.00
- Identified | = : « T . — — —
 ARarmarket Description » ’ ;d;l;l; | MsRP ‘I.}'Iscpunt‘ : Touli)l 3::;“” Opgonl;l;(:‘ta[;igg::lr\:ltlth
Option(s) S e nHNG COUNTY. " : » pRled Lis
=7 Page 1 of 2
[}
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Price Quote Form (PQF) - Motor Vehicles

Contract No.: 25100000-16-1

T -

Sini TOTAL COST: IDENTIFIED AFTERMARKET OPTIONS : - =
““Non-dentifled MG R R
;i ; : “MSRP-* | MSRP Dlscounl Tolal Discount Op!lon Total Gost with
Agmf)ﬂ . Desnriptlon SR 1. % . Doliars Applied Discount . -
CNG CNG CONVERSION b 11,850.00 ] - § 11,850.00
HD TOW HD TRAILER TOWING PACKAGE $ 825.00 X - : 825.00
9SB 9 FT, KNAPHEIDE UTILITY BODY FOR DRW $ 6,700.00 - 6,700.00
31V.31B SHIP THROUGH TO BODY MANUFACTURER, INCL. PDI b 260.00 - b ~ 260,00
4K 4,000 LB. STELLAR EC4000 WITH FM CONTROL b 17,900.00 - p 17,800.00
INCLUDES DUAL MANUAL OUTRIGGERS § - - $ - : -
TEMP TEMPORARY TAG 6.00 = b 6.00
3K THIRD KEY, PATS 140.00 - 140.00
LINEX SPRAY IN BEDLINER, TO INCLUDE TOPS OF BOXES 1,005.00 D 1,005.00
AND (2) MIDDLE WIDE COMPARTMENTS § - - 19 -
BUC INSTALL REAR VIEW CAMERA 200.00 - $ 200.00
OPT MASTER LOCKING SYSTEM b 450.00 - $ 450,00
OPT LED TAIL LIGHTS b 350.00 ] - E 350.00
OPT BRUSH & ALUMINUM TREADPLATE FRONT 375.00 = - $ 375.00
CD STERLING CAB GUARD, BLACK POWDER COATED 595,00 3 - § 595.00
OoPT 14 GALLON WASH TANK 215.00 b =18 215.00
OPT 6" PVC BLI- 020 LIDS 195.00 L - 195,00
OPT T- HANDLES 515.00 - 515.00
OPT 6- FLOOR TIES 255,00 - $ 255.00
1924 DEEP WINDOW TINT WITH WINSHIELD STRIP 275.00 - $ 275.00
DISCOUNT INSTALL ON RER VIEW CAMERA (200.00) p - 18 (200.00)
DISCOUNT SHIP THROUGH (260.00) - 13 {260.00),
BID# 15-28 - § -

- TOTAL COST: NON-|

DENTIFIED AFTERMARKET OPTIONS -

Additional Savings Off Contract Price Per Vehicle* (Please provide detailed information In Vendor Comments)

Vendor Comments:

Total Vehicles Quoted (Drop Down)

vehicle due to large order.

-| Additional Savings for Example: Quantity, Dealer Special, Customer Picked Up Vehicle. Ex:

DMS negotiated $50 off of contract price for XYZ

Agency Comments:

Please confirm vehicle color. If no color Is specified then the default is white.

*UNSPSC = United Natlons Standard Products and Services Commeodity Code

Page 2 of 2
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Attachment D.5 - Price Sheet - Product and Material Transport Vehicles
3 ldentified Aftermarket Options11
Bane Vedicle | OEM Optiona | Estimmted. [ B
Prics Oiscourt | Lasdtimain |- Nagtisala . | Yont (g g S el Tws Gubic Yory HD | Twre Cublc Yerg ND| . Thmes Cubic Yard .1 Texexfent
v . 10 {: Shisids, Berwy, | Shistds, Taps: | nch Langer | S¥me Body Packsge|  Eyma Bedy, HD Dy Bedy. Wiy Body B4,
S0, 908 00) [ ) Derys (008).: | % ; Y L | I maiar Qe 199 CAL,
1 |2017 ora Doy Fud50 DRW 2WWO Reg Cans 146~ WR 80 G4 XL (540 Deon Beld Ford $28,115.00 " 120 s 28000 (5 28000 ] § €800 [$ 658500 NoBid| s 783500 No Bid NoBld[3 463500 No Bid
Duvat Ford AE, . SDATARS o a3 {S 1000 (5 160003 02800 S 8860.00 NoBid | § 2,000.00 + NoBld NoBidls  510000[§ 540000
2 |2007 Ford super buty WD Reg Cab 15~ WB 65 CA XU (F4G) Don Reid Ford T1A000 " 1 s 26000 |8 26000 S 000 S eEIE00 Nogid|$ 7495.00 No Bld NoBld|$ 463500 No Bld
Duys) Ford LLE, $32,306.53 o na s 16000 (5 e008 s 92600 |$  $.560.00 No Bid | $ 3,000.00 No Bld NoBld|$s  sse000|3  sevone
s 2017 Fora Doty 5480 DRW WD Reg Cab 1537 W B G XL.(F4G) Don Reld Ford $29.062.00 ” 120 |$ 25000 | S 25080 |3 $35.00 NoBld|5  Tasse0 o Bid | S 259600 | $ 239500 NoBid|S 559500
Duval Ford (LG, $23,02631 ™ 2493 |3 16000 |5 180,00 |5 32000 |5 555000 |5 780000 [ 3 3.000.00 | $ 9,100.00 | $ 320000 |5  Samoe|s  san0m0
N Supar WD Reg Gab 187° W8 B4 CA XLT (eG) Don Reld Ford $31.787.00 1% 120 s 20000 |5 z80.00 |5 s35.00 Nogkd (s 7semc0 NoBld|$ 2,595.00 |3 ,395.00 NoBld[$ 5598500
RQuvel Ford LS, £32.450.88 n S8 is 460.00 [ 16000 | 22600 [$ 665000 (5 790000 (% 9,000.00 | 5 ,100.00 | § 220000 (5 610000 (5 540000
s |zorrora oy 201D Reg Gab 1937 WR 108" CA XL (F4G) Duval Ford LLC, 30028 3 L 10000 (3 000 |5 228500 [§ 65000 (8 780000 (% 9,00000 [ 5 $,100.00 | § 320000 |3 S10009{S  5400.00
. Don Reld ford ID9,002.00 0% 2 s 25000 |3 26000 | § $35.00 o 8id No Bid No Bid No Bld No Bid No Bld No Bld
© | 2047 Ford Super Duty R4S0 DRW 2WO Reg Eab 133 WR 108 CA XL (F4G) PAval Ford LLC, 210838 ~ 3 15 16000 |3 16000(5 £2600 |3 $560.00 (5 790000 (S 2,00000 [ 3 2.00.00 |5 220000 {$ 51008015 5400.00
Den Beid Ford $31,566.00 % ERE 25006 (5 2800015 35,00 No Bid No Bld No Bld No Bid No Bid NoBid [ No 8ld
7 (2017 Foret Super Duny Fut50 DRW 2WD Reg Cab 208 W 128% €A XL (RiG) Duel Ford WG, $29,426.08 "~ sear s 16000 (5 soo0 s ©500 (s ess000 s 7asono|s 200000 | $ 240000 (3 320000 |8 5100005 540000
Don Reig Ford 29,062.00 % 120 s 26000 (3 25000 [ 95,00 Ne Bld No Bld No Bid No Bld No Bid No BId Na Bid
2017 Ford Super Duty WD Reg Gab 208 W 126 GA XLT (ReG) uval Ford LG, 0.0 % ua |3 16000 [§ 160008 12800 {3 6550003 780003 100000 | 3 210000 | 3 220000 |§ 510080 (S 540000
Do Reig Ford +32,000.50 o 2 |s 28000 (5 25000 | 3 £95.00 No Bld No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bld No Bld No Bid
2017 Ford ouy Fo—— 168 W 0% CA X1 0} Don Beld Ford 230,456.50 ”» 2 s 2M00|$ 200} % £3500 |5 658800 NoBid| s 7.995.00 No Bid NoBl S 489800 No Bld
Ouval Ford LLG, 147488 % s |3 18000 [ s 18000 (% 22600 {$  8,550.00 No Rid No 8id No Bld NoRidlS 510000 [$  S40000
2047 Fora oty oRW 2WD Don Rsfd Ford £19,380.00 10% s 26000 (s 26000 |§ €850 (S 65800 NoBid|$ 7.996.00 No Bjd NoBid|s 463500 No Bid
Duval Ford LLG, £34,54882 3 aues |3 10000 | § 16000 |3 92500 |5 £.560.00 No Bld No Bid No Bid NoBid|$ 510000 [5 540000
st 2017 Fors oty F— Don Reld Ford $30,956.00 ” B 26000 [$ 25000 |3 635,00 NoBMd|$s 733600 NoBid |3 asssso s 233600 NoBld|S 658500
Super Derty Fa5U i
Duval Ford LG, Bl ”~ P E 16000 (s 16000 S v2500 (% ss000ls  7s0000(3 $,000.00 | 3 2,50000 | 5 320000 |5 £400.00 |5 540000
12 |2057 Ford Super Duty 2w Don Ryid Fard 70100 10% R E 2000 (§ 28000 |5 s36.00 NoBid|$  7.93500 NoRid|$ 259500 [ $ ,395.00 NoBid|5 569600
Duval Fog LS, ) o~ Lo £ 56000 {5 15000 | 3 92800 |$ 845000 s 720000 s 200000 | 3 2,405.00 | 5 220000 |5 540000 |3 540000
13 |2017 Ford Super DRW ZWD Gren. Cas 175 WB 85 GA XL (W4G) Don Reld Ford $34,487.00 ™ 12 s 28000 |$ 26000 |$ w600 |5 ss8600 NoBid|3 7.335.00 No Bid NoBld[ s  4ses00 No Bid
Dual Ferd LG maen ~ sess |3 16050 (5 16000 |3 2606 |3 855000 No @id No Bid No Bld NoBldf$  610000]5 540000
10 2017 Pord Super Duty WD Crew Cab 119 WB 60 CA XLT Ruyal Ford LLC, $3030831 ) 8488 1% 18000 |S 18000 |5 22600135 656000 No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBld[ s 510000 |5 540000
Qarber Ford Inc, $35,580,00 % 10420 NoBia{3  10k00|% 43500 |5 523600 Na Bid No Bid No 8id No Bld No Bid Ne Bid
s |2017 Fora Dy ORW ZWD Craw Cab 203 W8 86~ CA XL (4G} PenRald Ford £34,744.00 1% 12 s 26000 {26000 | § €35.00 NoRld|$S 789500 NoRid {5 250600 | 5 333500 NoBid|3 559500
Duvsl Ford LAG, $22,40050 % sz |3 1000015 160008 a2500 |3 65500005 7avosols 200000 | 5 2,1m0.00 | 3 220000 [ $ 510000 {3 540000
18 |2017 Fore Super uty W Crew Cab 265 WE 84 GA XLT (4G} Don Reid Ford $35,164.00 ™ L] 29000 {$ 28200 (S .36.00 NoBld{$ 733800 NoBid|$ 159600 |3 2.836.00 NoBid |3 659500
Duval Forg LLE, 53613558 % et |3 16000 [$ 1600003 a2600 [ sss000 (5" 7gc000|s 2,000.00 | 5 210000 | $ 320008 |5 640008 (3 §400.00
Ford Don Rsig Ford 529.783.00 ” 120 |3 26000 |3 28000 )% 63500 |3 858800 NoBid |3 79600 No Bld NoBld[ S  4a8s.00 No 8Id
17 {2017 Ford Super Duty F-650 DRW ZWD Reg Cab 145 WB £0° CA XL (F50) Puvel Ford 4G, 30400 o~ s |3 18000 (5 16000 |3 #2800 [ s esE0.00 No Bld No Bid No Bld NoBld[$  &1000 |5 seo000
Qurher Ford Ing, $20,05400 o $5-120 Nomld[s 106003 ass00 [ ¢ B280.00 No Rid No Bld No Bld No Bld o Bid No Bld
e 2017 Ford DR 2O Reg Cab 145~ WB §0° GA XLT (F50) Don Reid Ford $32367.00 ”» 120 i3 28008 (5 28000 |3 0500 |5 65800 NoBld{ $ 7,995.00 No Bld NoBid] 5 463800 No 8id
- Duval Ford LLG, manzn 0 48 |3 16000 (5 1ea00 (s s1500{3 656000 o Bid No Bid No Bld NoBid|$  S10000}3  S4onto
SU-Grodp AL o 2017 Ford Suay 2WD Rog Gab 168° WB 84° GA XL ) Don Reld Ford $23 854.00 ~ 120 3 28000 [ 5 25000 | 3 635.00 NoBid|S 7.935.00 NoBid|$ BE9500 [ 5 833500 NoBid| S 559500
| TRUGK, GREATER Super F4550 ORW {F50)
THANONETON & | Puval Ford LG, 53050494 3 8488 |$ 16000 | $ 160.00 | $ BWO0{S 655000 [$  T.000.00 | S 8,000.00 | 5 8,100,00 | $ 930000 | S 510000 |S  S4on00
LESS YHAKTWO | I onsy 2D R Cas T8 WE 84~ GA LT () Dan Reid Ford $32,4.00 " 120 |3 2s000|s 25000 | § s85.00 NoBld|s 739500 Nomid | g 258500 | § 333600 Nomld|§ 588500
IRNS. CHAZSIS: Super 550 DION
£A8,IWD Duval Forg LG, SNAZIAY 3 uee |3 14000 |S 16000 |5 125003  sgm000 s 7A0000 |3 300000 | 3 3,100.00 [ 3 320000 |3 SA0000 | S 540000
1 2087 Ford Super Dty F-550 DRW 2WD Fleg Cab 183 WE 108 CA XL (F50) Duaal Forf LLG, s02308 ~ sest |3 18000 [§ 16000 | 3 8500 {5 85000 (3 780000 (5 200000 { 5 2.10090 |5 370000 |5 5100.00(5  5400.00
par DRW
Don Reld Forg $30.054.00 ” 120 |3 26000 |8 260003 935.00 No Bid No Bl o Bld No Bid No md ¥o B No Bid
2 2017 Ford Dty F-550 DRW ZWD Reg Gab 185 Wi 108~ CA XLT (FEG) Duval Ford WG, s =~ s {3 6000 |§ 160008 82500 |$  ess000ls  7reseon s 2,000 | $ 2,100.0¢ | 3 920000 |5 510000 [$ 540000
Ren Reld Ford $32,80.00 ” R 200013 280003 £95.00 No Bid No Bld No Bid o &id No 8id No Bld No Bid
[ g Cab 205~ WB 125 CA XL (F53) Dval Ford LG, £30,91.23 ~ e |s 16000 |5 16000 1§ 82500 [$ 655000 (3 780000 [ 5 2,000.00 | § 2,500,00 [ 3 320000 |5 SI0000 (5 540000
‘ard Supar Duty F-650 DRW 2WD .
DenReld Ford FI0.864.00 ” e |3 25000 [§ 25000 |5 €95.00 No Bid o Bid No Bid No iid No Bid No Bl Na Bld
2 Ford Super Duty 20D Reg Cab 205" WB 1207 CA XLT Ruval Ford 44, SRIVAY 03 2433 |3 15000 | 5 1samo | 3 ®2500 |5 658000 |5 7.80n.00 (% 200000 | 5 200400 | 5 220000 | $ 840000 |3 K400.00
2017 ipar Duty F-580 DRW. (F85)
Pen Reisl Ferd B2Ma.00 ” R 25000 (5 28000 |3 €35.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No 8ld No Bld No fld
5 |20 Fora ouey . 26587 W 60 CA XL i) Pen Reld Ford $34,857.00 ” s %000 (3 280008 #1600 [ $ 68500 NoBld|$ 7.896.00 No Bid NoBld|S 488600 No Bld
Duvel Farg MG, $24431 " X 18000 [§  1e000 s 22800 3 8,850.00 Na Bld o Bid NoBid NoBld} §  €10000 |5 540000
2 | 2017 Fora super Dty wp 260 W8 60* CA XLT (K509 oo Beld Forg © 5448200 3 2 |3 28000 (3 25000 |3 §1500|S 659600 NoBid| s Ta800 No Bl NoBld{3s 48800 No Bid
il Sunlreni G, FI5M40 < e |5 16000 (8 16000 )% 02500 |5 685000 No Bid o 8ld No Bid NoBW[$ 5100005 540000
- et nn i cva vt e o0 Aid Ford £21,567.00 " 120 |3 28000 |3 28000 |3 15,50 NoBid|$ 738600 NoBid} S £,586.90 | $ 239600 NoBld|s  5Se800
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Skip to Main Content

Department of Management Services

Florida Department of Management Services > Business Operations > State Purchasing > Vendor Information > State
Contracts and Agreements > State Term Contracts > Motor Vehicles

<< Return
Motor Vehicles 25100000-16-1

Effective Period  11/17/2015 through 11/16/2017
Contract Type State Term Contract

¢ Pricing
s Contractors
Contracit How to Use this Contract
Information Frequently Asked Questions - Users

Frequently Asked Questions - Vendors

Forms and Qther Information

Contract Microsoft Word (' 203.33 KB)
Documents PDF (% 2,08 MB) -
Amendments and Memorandums
Contract  Jennifer Hyatt

_ - e (850) 414-6741
Administration . jennifer.hyatt@dms.myflorida.com

. UNSPSC-25101500, UNSPSC-25101503, UNSPSC-25101505, UNSPSC-25101507
Commodity Codes (yspsc.35101600, UNSPSC-25101702 '

Description

This is a statewide contract for Motor Vehicles. This contract provides State Agencies and eligible users with the ability to
purchase new 2016 models at a discount off of MSRP on: automobiles, passenger vans, cargo vans, sport utility vehicles,
light pickup trucks, chassis-cab trucks, low-speed vehicles, truck bodies, and installed options. Styles Include: Law
Enforcement Automobiles, Law Enforcement SUVs, Law Enforcement Motorcycles, Automobiles, Low-Speed Vehicles,
Passenger Vans, Cargo Vans, SUVs, and Pickup and Chassis-Cab Trucks (Class 1 through Class 5).

The Department strongly encourages ALL potential users of this contract to plan ahead to prevent any potential delays.
Please review the Contract Documents, "How to Use this Contract" Instructions, and "Frequently Asked Questions” for this
State Term Contract.

Benefits

State of Florida Base Vehicle Prices and Options Discounts equate to average approximate discount 70% percent off of list
price (MSRP).

« Additional discounts possible for large quantity, identical motor vehicle, orders.

Brands Include: Chevrolet, Club Car, Cruise Car, Dodge, Ford, Freightliner, GEM, GMC, Jeep, Motor Electric, Nissan,
Toyota, Harley Davidson, International and RAM,

« Wide product selection with approximately 755 State of Florida Base Vehicles on contract, each with associated Manufacturer's
Optlons, and select Aftermarket Options.

Manufacturer's standard most-inclusive government Warranty.

Lead-Time: Approximate 30 - 190 Days (Based on State of Florida base vehicle, options and production).




Prices established for th'e State of Florida Base Vehicles individually include the following charges and fees:

. Administrative

. Environmental

. Title Application and Registration
. Plate Transfer

. Preparation

. Handling

. Freight

. Shipping

W 0 N O U D W N =

. FOB Delivery to any point within the State of Florida
10. Warranty and
11. Any other charges or fees necessary to deliver the State of Florida Base Vehicle according to the
requirements, '
specifications, terms, and conditions, exclusive of taxes.

Document reader dbw_nload link

. f"iMS Word Viewer
. !‘;x“ﬂ\Adobe PDF Reader




25100000-16-1 Motor Vehicles

State of Florida

Vendor Information Form

Contractor Information

Respondent Name:

Duval Ford LLC.

Eg:spondent FEIN 27-3646082
Street Address: 1616 CASSAT AVE

City, State, and Zip:

JACKSONVILLE, FL 32210

Internet Address:

WWW.DUVALFORD.COM

Telephone No.:

904-381-2144

Toll-Free No.:
Fax No.: 904-381-6556
Contract Administers
Information: Primary Contact Secondary Contact
Name: MATT FORTE v GARY CHARLESWORTH
Title: GOVERNMENT SALES MANAGER OPERATIONS MANAGER
Street Address: 16168 CASSAT AVE 1616 CASSAT AVE

City, State, and Zip:

JACKSONVILLE, FL 32210

JACKSONVILLE, FL 32210

E-mail Address:

MATT.FORTE@DUVALFLEET.COM

GARY.CHARLESWORTH@DUVALFLEET.CO

M

Telephone No: 904-381-2144 904-381-2144
Toll-Free No.:

Cell Phone No.: 904-505-9682

Fax No.: 904-381-6556

Ordering and Remit-To Information Please provide information where Customers should direct
orders. You must provide a regular mailing address and e-mail address. If equipped to receive
purchase orders electronically, you may also provide an Internet Address.

Remit-To: DUVAL FORD LLC
Remit-To Street

Address: 1618 CASSAT AVE
Remit-To City,

State, and Zip:

JACKSONVILLE, FL 32210

Remit-To E-mail
Address:

MATT.FORTE@DUVALFLEET.COM
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